
I assent.

µ� 

BRITISH GUIANA 

Officer Administering
the Government.

"' :u+ June, 1955.

ORDINANCE No. 26 OF 1955.
AN ORDINANCE to amend the Executive and Legislative Councils

(Remuneration of Members) Ordinance, 1953.
Enacted by the Legislature of British Guiana: - A.D. 1955.

1. This Ordinance may be cited as the Executive and Legis- Sho;-;tl lative Councils (Remuneration of Members) (Amendment) 1 e.
Ordinance, 1955, and shall be construed and read as one with the 
Executive and Legislative Councils (Remuneration of Members) No. 28 ofOrdinance, 1953, hereinafter referred to as the Principal Ordin- 1953.

ance.
2. Section two of the Principal Ordinance is hereby

amended -
(a) by the substitution for the words "seven thousand two

hundred dollars" in sub-section (1) of the words "ten
thousand and eighty dollars"; and

Amend
ment of 
section 2
of the 
Principal 
Ordinance.



No. 26] 

Amend
ment of 
section 3 
of the 
Principal 
Ordinance. 

Com
mence-
ment. 

2 

THE LAWS OF BRITISH GUIANA [A.D. 1955. 

(b) by the substitution for the words "th:r:ee thousand six
hundred dollars" in sub-section (2) of the words "five
thousand and forty dollars". , 1_ - , 1t 

3. Section three of the Principal Ord'inan.ce is hereby
amended by the substitution for the words "one thousand nine 
hundred and twenty dollars" of the words "three thousand 
dollars". 

,, 

4. The provisions of this Ordinance shall'be· deemed to have
come into operation on the 1st January, 19M. 

Passed, b�J the Legis'lative Council this twj-ihird
June, nineteen hund,·ed and fifty.five.

� 1 

��f the Leeisza,Ji 
(Leg. Bill No. 26/1955). 

e:-intetl by the Government Printer� o, British Guiana 

day of 

----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------


