
GUYANA 

ACT No. 9 OF l997 

PREVENTION OF CRIMES (AMENDMENn ACT 1997 

r assenl".. 

SAMUEL A. HINDS. 
President. 
8th August, 1997. 

ARRANGEMBN'l' OF SECTLONS 

SE(.'.'l'l{)N 
l. Short tilllc.
2. Amendment o[ the Principal Act .

.l�RICE: $75.00 - :ro he purchased from the OHice of th)(� Prt:..\•d<lent; 'Georg(:tow11; 
(Juyam!a. 

lllRllN:'rED BY G(FYANA NATJONAfJ., JJ\RllN'J'}JRS rJ.�TD. 



No, 9] 

A.D. 1997 

Shiirt title. 
Cap. 9:01 

Amendment. 
of the 
Princ1pal 
Act. 

2 

LAWS OF GUYANA [A.I). 1gg7 

AN ACI' to amend the Prevention of Crimes Act. 

Ena<.Yted by the Parliament of <Juyana:----

1. This Act. which amends the Prevention of Crimes A.;t,
may be dted as the Prevention of Crimes (Amendment) Act 1997. 

2. 'Jlhe sccOons of the Principal Act mentioned in the first;
column of the Schedule are hereby amended in the manner specified 
in the corresponding entry in tbe s�:on<l column of the Schedule. 

SCHEDULE 

FIRST COLUMN 
SECTIONS 

SEOOND COLUMN 
/\MENDMENTS 

Sect inn 7 

Section 8 

Section 9 

12 

Section 15 

Section 16 

Se:ction 18 

For ''seventy-five'' 
huhJrcd'' and for 
thousand". 

r:uh:;;titute "s1.:.�ven thousand five 
hundrc<.P' �;ubstitute "fifteen 

fo paragraph (b) for "three hundred" substitute 
"fifteen thousand". 

ln subsection (2) for "seventy-five'' substitute "scv�:1 
thousand five hundred" and for "one lmndred and 
fifty" substitute "ten thousand". 

In subsection (l) (a) for ''four 1hundred" substitute 
"twenty thousand". 

In subsection (4) for "three hundred" substitute 
"fifteen thousand". 

In subsection (2) for "three hundred" substitute 
"fifteen thousand�, and for "one thousand'' substitute 
"forty thousand". 

For ''seven hundred and fifty" substitute "thirty 
thousand". 

Passed by the National Assembly on 21st July, 1997. 

F. A. Na'fain, 
Clerk of the National Assembly. 

(BILL No. 8/1997) 


	Page 1
	Page 2

