
GUYANA 

ACT No. 1611997 
:·,;MOTOR VEHICLF.S INSURANCE (THIRD PARTY RISKS)

(AMENDMENT ACT 1997 
; asseyt. 

�·· 

�� 

:St!CfION 
:.,, 1 

1. 

2. 

3. 

4. 

5. 

President. 
gtAugust. 1997 

ARRANGEMENT OF SECTIONS
Short title. Amendment of section 3 of the Principal Act. Amendment of section 21 of the Principal Act. Amendment of section 2A of the Principal Act. Amendll,l�nt. ··of section 25 of the Principal Act · 



No. 16) 

A. D. 1997
Short title, 

Cap. 51:03 

Amendment of section 3 of the Princl.t>alAct. 

Amendment 
of section 21 l!_f. thePrlnclAct.

 
 pal

Amenclment 
of section M
of the PrincipalAct. 

Amendment 
of section 25 
of the PrincipalAct. 

2 

LAWS OF GUYANA {A.D. 19sr? 

AN ACT to amend the Motor Vehicles Insurance (Third Party 
Risks) Act. 

Enacted by the Parliament 'of Guyana:-

1. This Act. which amends the Motor Vehicles Insurance
(Third Party Risks) Act, may be cited as the Motor Vehicles In
surance (Third Party Risks) (Amendment) Act 1997. 

2. Section 3 of the Principal Act is hereby amended by the
substitution in subsection (2) fot the words "seven hundred and 
fiftf' of the words "twenty-five thousand". 

3. Section 21 of the Principal Act is hereby amended by
the substitution -

(a) in subsection(}) (ii) for the words "'one thous-
and five hundred" of the words "forty thousand'.,;

(b) in subsectioii (2) for the words "seven hundred and
fifty" of the wor<.ts "twenty-five thousand":

(c) in subsection (3) for the words "one thousand
five hundred" of the words "fifty thousand''.

4, Sc:tion 24 of the Principal Act is hereby' amended by 
the substitution -

(a) in subsection (1) for the words "three hundred" of
the words "fifteen thousand";

(b) in subsection (3) for the word "fifteen" of the
words "one thousand";

(c) in the proviso to subsection (3) for the words '·ttlt'ee
hundred'' of the words '�fifteen thousand".

5. Section 25 of the Principal Act is hereby amended by the
substitution in subsection (2) for the words "three hundred" of the
words "fifteen thousand''.

Passed by the National Assembl11 on 21st Jl:!_..19;1 �

F. A. Narain., 
Clerk of the Nati<.'nal Assembly. 

(BILL No. 16/1997) 


	Page 1
	Page 2

