
BILL No. 20 of 1992 THURSDAY, 16TH JULY, 1992 

PARLIAMENT OFFICE, 
Public Buildings. 

Georgetown. 
Guyana. 

9~7-16 . . 

The following Bill which will be introduced in the National Assembly 
is published for general information. 

SECTION 

F. A. Narain, 
Clerk of the National Assembly . 

• GUYANA 
BILL No. 20 of 1992 

MEMBERS' CLUBS {AMENDMENT) BILL 1992 

ARRANGEMENT OF SECTIONS 

1. Short title. 
2. Amendment of section 4 of the Principal Act. 
3. Amendment of section 5 of the Principal Act. 
4. Amendment of section 6 of the Principal Act. 
5. Amendment of section 10 of the Principal Act. 

to t 



A. D. 1992 

Short title 
Ca,p, 82:26 

.AmenA
ment ol 
aeetton • 
ef the 
Prlncl.Pal 
Act. 

~end.. 
:ment of 
aection 6 
of the 
Principal 
Act. 

Alllleip ==n~ 
of the 
PrlnalPal 
Act. 

Amend
ment of 
aectl.OD 10 
of the 
Prtnclpai 
Ad, 

A BILL 

Intituled 

AN ACT to amend the Members' Clubs Act. 

Enacted by the Parliament of Guyana:-

1. This Act, which amends the Members' Clubs Act, 
may be cited as the Members' Clubs (Amendment) Act 1992. 

2. Section 4 of the Principal Act is hereby amended 
as follows -

(a) in subsection '(l), by the substitution for the 
words "one thousand dollars" of the words "ten 
thousand dollars"; 

(b) in subsection (2), by the substitution for the words 
"two hundred and fifty dollars" of the words 
"two thousand five h dred dollars". 

3. Section ~1) and (2) is hereby amended by the sub
stitution for the words "one thousand dollars" of the words 
''ten thousand dollars". 

~ . Section 6(,3) ~ the Principal Act is hereby amended 
by the -substitution for -the words "fifty dollars" of the words 
"one thousand dollars''. 

ij. Section 10 of the Principal Act is hereby amended 
by the substitution for the words "fifty dollars" and "one 
hundred dollars" of the words "five hundred dollars" and 
"one thousand dollars", respectively. 

EXPLANATORY MEMORANPUM 

This Bill seeks. to amep~ th~ Members' Clubs Act, Ca~. 82:26, to in
crease, by approxunately ten times, the fines to be paid for offences 
commit~d u~y.~~ the A~. . . ' 

Carl B. Greenidge; 
Minister of Finance. 




