
. . . 

BILL No. 4 of 1993 r Monday 15th March 1993 

PARLIAMENT OFFICE. 
Public Buildings, 

Georgetown. 
Guyana. 

1993-03-15 

The following Bill which will be introduced in the National Assembly is 
published for general information. 

F. A. �arain, 
Clerk of the National Assembly. 

CUYANA 

BILL No. 4 of 1993 

SPIRITS (AMENDMENT) BILL 1993 

ARRANGEMENT OF SECTIONS 

SECTION 
1. Short title.
2. Amendment of the Principal Act

9 



Sections 

Section 22 (4) 

Section 23 (5) 

Section 23 (6) 

Section 26 (3)

Section 27 (4)

Section 27 (5) 

Section 31 (5) 

Section 31 (6) 

Section 32 (3)

Section 34 (2)

Section 35 (3) 

Section 36 (5) 

Section 37 (7) 

Section 37 (8) 

Section 38 (3) 

I 

Amendments 

 

For "seven hundred and fifty dollars" substitute "seven 
thousand five hundred dollars'\ 

For "one ,thousand f ive hundred dollars" substitute 
"fifteen thousand dollars". 

For "one hundred and fifty dollars'• substitute "one 
thousand five hundred dollars". 

For "one thousand five hundred dollars" substitute 
"fifteen ,thousand dollars". 

For "one thousand five hundred dollars'' substitute 
"fifteen thousand dollars". 

For "one thousand five hundred dollars'' substitute 
"fifteen thousand dollars". 

For "one thousand five hundred dollars'• substitute 
"fifteen thousand dollars". 

For "three thousand dollars" substitute ".thirty thous
and dollars". 

For "one hundre:l and fifty dollars" substitute 
"fifteen thousand dollars". 

For "one thousand five hundred dollars'• substitute 
"fifteen thousand dollars". 

For "one thousand five hundred dollars'• substitute 
"fifteen thousand dollars". 

For "three thousand dollars" substitute "thirty thous
and dollars''. 

For "thr.ee :thousand dollars" substitute ''thirty thous
and dollars''. 

For "one hundred and fifty dollars" substitute "two 
thousand dollars". 

or. "one thousand five hundred dollars'' substitute 

en thousand dollars". 

-- ' 1 



Secdo111 

Section 42 (2) 

Sec.tion 43 (5) 

Section 54 (2) 

Section 56 (7)

Section 5S (1) 

Section ,3 (2) 

Section 64 (2) 

Section 65 (2)

Section 68 

Section 69 (2) 

Section 78 (3) 

Section 81 

Section 82 (1) 

4-,ection 89 (1) 

Section 90 (1) 

Amendments 

For "three thousand dollars. and to a further fine 
of five dollars'' substitute ''thirty thousand dollars. 
and ,to a further fine of one hundr.ed dollars", 

For "three hundred dollars" substitute "three thous
and dollars". 

For "one thousand five hundred dollars" substitute 
"fifteen thousand dollars". 

For "one thousand five hundred dollars" substitute 
"fifteen thousand dollars". 

For "six thousand dollars" substitute "sixty thousand 
dollars". 

For "seven hundred and fifty dollars" substitute ''seven 
thousand five hundred dollars". 

For ".seven hundred and fifty dollars" substitute .. seven 
thousand five hundred doUarS"'. 

For "fifteen dollars'' substitute "three hund� 
dollars". 

For "one thousand five hundred dollars" substitute 
fifteen thousand dollars''. 

For "one hundned and fifty dollars" substitute "one 
thousand five hundred dollars''. 

For "s.even hundred and fifty dollars" substitute "seven 
thousand five hundred dollars". 

For "one thousand five hundred dollars" substitute 
"f.ifteen thousand doJlars". 

For "one thousand five !hundred dollars" substitute 
"fifteen thousand dollars". 

For "three thousand dollars'' substitute •'thirty thol,lS
aod dollars". 

For "one thousand five hundred dollars" substitute 
"fifteen thousand dollars". 

• 



Sections 

Section 91 

Section 92 

Section 93 

Section 94 

Section 95

Section 97 

Section 98 (1) 

Section 99 

Section 100 

Section 101 

Section 104 '(3) 

Section 105 (1) 

Section 105 (2) 

Section 107 (2) 

Section 109 

ill 

• I JI O.:

I ,,1 

5 

Amendments 

• r 

For "one thousand five hundred dollars" substitute 
"fifteen thousand dollars". 

For "one hundred and fifty dollars" substitute "one 
thousand fiv.e hundred dollars". 

For "three thousand dollars" substitute "thirty thous
and dollars". 

For "three thousand dollars" substitute "thirty thous
and dollars". 

For "three thousand dollars" substitute "thirty thous.. 
and dollars". 

For "three thousand dollars" substitute "·tlbirty thous
and dollars". 

For "three thousand dollars'' substitute "thirty thous· 
and dollars". 

For "three thousand dollars" substitute ''thirty thous
and dollars". 

For "three hundred dollars" substitute "three thous
and dollars". 

For "one thousaoo five hundred dollars" substitute 
"fifteen thousand dollars". 

For "three thousand doJlars'• substitute "thirty thous
and dollars". 

For "one thousand five hundred dollars" substitute 
"fifteen thousand dollars". 

For "one thousand five hundred dollars" substitute 
"fifteen thousand dollars". 

For "three hundred dollars" substitute "three thous
and dollars". 

For "seven hundred and fifty dollars" substitute "seven 
thousand five hundred dollars". 



6 

EXPLANATORY MEMORANDUM 

. ' 

Thls Bill seeks to amend the Spirits Aot, Cap. 82:24. to increase the penal-
ties for certain offences committed under the Act. 

Asgar Ally, 
Senior Minister of Fina.DQe. 

.. 4 
f I 




