
THE OFt=[CU:�:., Gt�::'.::tr
r

�\j 15�2'["� t. P;::) !�
.... .. ,;:i,. .. D<a) 

GUYANA 

L EGA l $'. ;J � � = l �rt;'j � f�T 

No. 1 of 1989 

BY-LAWS 

Made Under 

THE MU��CIP.-·\L AND DISTRICT COUi\'CILS ACT 

(Cap. 28:01) 

l:�DSR SECTIO:; 30:0 .-\>JD 80� Of THE l\:IU:·-ICIPAL AND DISTTIICT 
COUNCILS :.\'CT. THE FOLLO\VING BY-LA \'.'S HAVE BEE\1 i\IADE 
BY THE MAYOR :\�,:D C'.::TJ\7C.'.!LLO=-:S OF THE CITY OF GEORGE

TOW:\" .-\ND -�-�PROVED BY TEE l\1I!'\ISTETI:-

l. These by-laws which amend the City (Burial Ground) Ci:aiion. 
By-Laws mav be cited as the City (Burial Ground) (Arnenciment) 
By-Laws 1989. 

2. By-La.\\' 10 of the Principal By-Laws is hereby amend- :;�':�t�;; uv-
e<l in the following respects:- Law 10. 

0 
V• 

(a) in paragraph (1) by the substitution for the
words "two dollars and seventy-five cents" of the
words "ten dollars".

(b) in paragraph (2) by the substitution for the words
"three dollars" of the words "twenty dollars".

The Schedule to the Principal By-Laws is hereby delet- .-,rnc 11c1-

ed and the following Schedule substituted therefor- ���,'��";•;_ 



110 T:n: OFFICIAL GAZE'I'TE L2Gr\L SuPPLL\IENT -- B 15TH APRIL, l!l89 

By-Law 11 ''SCHEDULE" 

Interment 

FEE:-,; 

$.C 

For the intennent of the x:orpse of any person above the age of 
12 years · 20.00 

For the interment of the corpse of any person above the age 
12 years at public expense 20.00 

For the interment of the corpse of a child above the age of 1 
year and not above 12 years or age 15.0'0 

For the interment of the corpse of a child above the age of 
1 year and not above ·12 years of age at public expense 15.00 

For the inteirment of the corpse of a child of 1 year and under 10.00 

For the intennent of the corpse of a child of 1 year and under 
at public expense 10.00 

For the Interment of twins of 1 year and under 20.00 

For the permission to build a one-chamber tomb or vault 15.00 

For permission to build a two-chamber or vault 60.00 

For permission to erect a fence or railing enclosing a grave, 
or to place a stone or tablet upon any grave 20.00 

For the privilege of choosing a particuJar site for a grave 20.00 

For the exhumation of the corpse of any person 560.00 

For the opening and c:leaning of a tomb 225.00 

For the demolishing of a tomb 225.00 

For digging to a depth of one foot the spot for the building 
of tomb 25.00 

For digging one foot wide around grave for the purpose of a pave 15.00 

For cligging 18 inches wide around grave for the purpose of a 
pave 20.00 

l\Iade by the Mayor and City :Council of Georgetown this 13th day of 
March, 1989. 

G. Faucett.

TOWN CLERK. 

Approved this 7th day of April, 1989. 

J. Thomas.

MINISTER OF REGION AL DEVELOPMENT. 


	Page 1
	Page 2

