
40 THE OFFICIAL GAZETTE LEGAL SuPPLEMENT - B 3ls'I' JAN., 1987 

GUYAN/-.. No. 14 of 1987 

ORDER 

Made Under 

THE LOCAL DEMOCRATIC ORGANS ACT 1980 

(Act No. 12 of 1980) 

IN EXERCISE OF THE POWERS CONFERRED UPON ME BY SEC
TION 9 OF THE LOCAL DEMOCRATIC ORGANS ACT 1980, I 
HEREBY MAKE THE FOLLOWING ORDER:-

Citation andco=encement. 
1. This Order, which amends the Local Democratic Organs

(Emoluments of Office-holders) Order 1985* may be cited as the 
Local Democratic Organs (Emoluments of Office-holders) (Amend
ment) Order 1987 and shall be deemed to have come into opera
tion on 1st January, 1986. 

, . 

Amendment 2. The Principal Order is hereby amended in the following of thjl Prln•respects -clpal Order. 

(a) by the substitution in clause 2 •(1) for the words
"two thousand five hundred dollars" of the words
"three thousand and twenty-five dollars", and for
the words "three hundred dollars" wherever they
occur of the words "five hundred dollars";

(b) by the substitution in clause 2 (2) for the words
"one thousand nine hundred dollars" of the words
"two thousand three hundred dollars", and for the
full stop of a colon; and

(c) by the insertion after clause 2 (2) of the following
proviso -

··No. 14 of 1.985.';

"Provided that the salary each month for the chairman and 
vice-chairman for the period that commenced on 1st January, 
1985 and ended 31st December, 1985, shall be two thousand 
seven hundred and fifty dollars and two thousand and ninety 
dollars respectively.". 

Made this 30th day of January, 1987. 

Jeffrey R. Tho;;;m,
Minister of Regional Development. 


	Page 1

