
22ND DEC., 1984 THE OFFICIAL GAZETTE LEGAL SUPPLEMENT - B 313 

GUYANA 

ORDER 

Made Under 

No. 65 of 1984 

THE MINISTERS, MEMBERS OF THE NATIONAL ASSEMBLY 

AND SPECIAL OFFICES (EMOLUMENTS) ACT 

(Cap. 1:07) 

IN EXERCISE OF THE POWERS CONFERRED UPON THE MINISTER 
BY SECTION 8 OF THE MINISTERS, MEMBERS OF THE NA.TIO�• 
AL ASSEMBLY AND SPECIAL OFFICES (EMOLUMENTS) ACT, fl 
HEREBY MAKE THE FOLLOWING ORDER :-

1. This Order may be cited as the Ministers, Members of c1tat1on

the National Assembly and Special Offices (Emoluments) Order �i�mence
(No. 2) 1984 and shall be deemed to have come into operation ment.
on 1st J'l'y, 1984, except in respect of the provisions relating 
to a Parliamentary Secretary and Every other Member of the 
National Assembly which shall be deemed to have come into 
operation on ist January, 1984. 

2. 
lows -

The Schedule to the Act is hereby amended as fol- Amendment 
of lhe 

Schedule to
the Act. 

(a) in paragraph 1, by the substitution for the words
"other than the Prime Minister" of the words
"(other than the Prime Minister) and every De
puty Prime Minister" and for the words "$24,000",
"$22,800", "$21,600", "$18,000", "$15,000",
"$9,000", "$22,800", "$6,000", "$14,400" and
"$4,200" of the words "$60,000", "$50,400",
"$42,000", "$30,000", "$18,000", "$12,000",
"$50,400", "$9,600", "$24,000" and "$7,200" re
spectively;



314 THE OFFICIAL GAZETTE LEGAL SUPPLEMENT - B 22ND DEC., J 984 

(b) in paragraph 2, by the substitution for the words
"$3,000" where they occur for the second and
third times of the words "$4,800";

(c) in paragraph 3, by the substitution for the words
"(other than the Prime Minister)" of the words
"(other than the Prime Minister) and every De
puty Prime Minister" and for the words "$3,000"
and "$1,800" of the words "$6,000";

(d) in paragraph 4, by the substitution -
(i) in subparagraph (a) for the words "$1,000" of

the words "$1,500";

(ii) in subparagraph (b) for the words "(other
than the Prime Minister)" of the words "(other
than the Prime Minister), every Deputy Prime
Minister" and for the words "$500" of the
words "$700';

(iii) in subparagraph (c) for the words "A Senior
Minister" of the words "A Senior Minister
and every other Minister" and for the words
"$350" of the words "$700";

(iv) in subparagraph (d) for the words "$600" of

the words "$700".

Made this 20th day of December, 1984. 

Carl B. Greenidge, 
Minister of Finance. 


	Page 1
	Page 2

