24
                            THE OFFICIAL GAZETTE [LEGAL SUPPLEMENT]     —    A            16TH JANUARY, 2017
No. 7]                                                             LAWS  OF  GUYANA                                                [A.D. 2017

25
THE OFFICIAL GAZETTE [LEGAL SUPPLEMENT]  —   A                       16TH JANUARY, 2017

A.D. 2017]               INTOXICATING LIQUOR LICENSING (AMENDMENT) ACT 2017                    [No. 7


THE OFFICIAL GAZETTE   16TH JANUARY, 2016
LEGAL SUPPLEMENT —  A

[image: image1.emf]
GUYANA
ACT NO. 7 OF 2017
INTOXICATING LIQUID LICENSING (AMENDMENT) ACT 2017
[image: image2.png]I assent.

Vil A

David Granger,
Pr ident.

J&l 111 a?j /é Yy




ARRANGEMENT OF SECTIONS

SECTION

1.
Short title.

2.
Amendment of the Principal Act.
[image: image3.png]AN ACT to amend the Intoxicating Liquor Licensing Act.

AD2017 Enacted by the Parliament of Guyana:-

Short title.
Cap. 82:21

Amendments
of the Principal
Act.

1. This Act, which amends the Intoxicating Liquor Licensing Act, may be cited

as the Intoxicating Liquor Licensing (Amendment) Act 2017.

2. The provisions of the Principal Act specified in column one of the TABLE
are amended in the manner specified in the corresponding entries in column

two.

TABLE

SECTION

AMENDMENT

Section 13(1)(a)

by substituting for the words “five thousand dollars” wherever they appear the
words “ten thousand dollars™.

Section 32 (1) (a) by substituting for the words “ two thousand dollars ” the words “four
thousand dollars ”;
(b) by substituting for the words “five hundred dollars” the words “two
thousand dollars”.
Section 43 (a) by substituting for the words  three thousand dollars ” the words “ six
thousand dollars™;
(b) by substituting for the words “fifteen thousand dollars” the words “thirty
thousand dollars™.
Section 44 (1) | (a) by substituting for the words “five thousand dollars” the words “ten

thousand dollars™;

(b) by substituting for the words “fifty thousand dollars™ the words “one
hundred thousand dollars”.





2

[image: image4.png]Section 44 (2)

(a) by substituting for the words “five thousand dollars” the words “ten
thousand dollars”;

(b) by substituting for the words “fifty thousand dollars” the words “one
hundred thousand dollars”.

Section 45(1)

(a) by substituting for the words “five thousand dollars  the words “ten thousand
dollars ;

(b) by substituting for the words “fifty thousand dollars” the words “one hundred
thousand dollars”.

Section 46 (1)

(a) by substituting for the words “one thousand dollars” the words “two thousand
dollars™;

(b) by substituting for the words “three thousand dollars” the words “six thousand
dollars”;

(c) by substituting for the words “six thousand dollars” the words “twelve thousand
dollars”.

Section 47 (3)

by substituting for the words “two thousand dollars” the words “four
thousand dollars”.

Section 48

(a) by substituting for the words “five thousand dollars” the words “ten
thousand dollars™;

(b) by substituting for the words “ten thousand dollars” the words “twenty
thousand dollars”.

Section 49 (3)

by substituting for the words “five thousand dollars” the words “ten thousand
dollars”.

Section 50 (4)

(a) by substituting for the words “five hundred thousand dollars” the words
“one million dollars™;

(b) by substituting for the words “one million dollars™ wherever they appear





3

[image: image5.png]the words “two million dollars”.

Section 51(4)

(a) by substituting for the words “five hundred thousand dollars™ the words
“one million dollars”;

(b) by substituting for the words “one million dollars” wherever those words
appear the words “two million dollars”.

Section 52(2)

(a) by substituting for the words “one thousand dollars” the words “two
thousand dollars”;

(b) by substituting for the words “three thousand dollars” the words “six
thousand dollars”.

Section 53 (2)

(a) by substituting for the words “five thousand dollars™ the words “ten
thousand dollars™;

(b) by substituting for the words “ten thousand dollars” the words “twenty
thousand dollars”.

Section 54(2)

(a) by substituting for the words “two thousand dollars ” the words “four
thousand dollars™;

(b) by substituting for the words “five thousand dollars” the words “ten
thousand dollars™.

Section 55 (2)

by substituting for the words “ten thousand dollars™ the words “twenty
thousand dollars™.

Section 56(2)

by substituting for the words “three thousand dollars” the words “six thousand
dollars”.

Section 57 (3)

[

(a) by substituting for the words “three thousand dollars” the words “six
thousand dollars™;





4

[image: image6.png](b) by substituting for the words “fifteen thousand dollars” the words “thirty
thousand dollars”.

Section 58

by substituting for the words “three thousand dollars” the words “six thousand
dollars”.

Section 60

(a) by substituting for the words “five thousand dollars” the words “ten
thousand dollars”;

(b) by substituting for the words “three thousand dollars” the words “six
thousand dollars”.

Section 61(2)

by substituting for the words “three thousand dollars™ the words “six thousand
dollars”.

Section 62(2)

(a) by substituting for the words “three thousand dollars” the words “six
thousand dollars”;

(b) by substituting for the words “fifteen thousand dollars” the words “thirty
thousand dollars™.

Section 63

by substituting for the words “three thousand dollars” the words “six thousand
dollars”.





Passed by the National Assembly on the 6th January, 2017.
[image: image7.png]/§ E. %aacs,

Clerk of the National Assembly.




(BILL No. 32/2016)
5

_1201089599.unknown

