NATIONAL ASSEMBLY

MINUTES OF PROCEEDINGS
OF THE 59TH SITTING OF THE NATIONAL ASSEMBLY OF THE FIRST

SESSION (2015-2017) OF THE ELEVENTH PARLIAMENT OF GUYANA HELD

AT 2.00 P.M.,

FRIDAY, 6TH JANUARY, 2017,

IN THE PARLIAMENT CHAMBER, PUBLIC BUILDINGS,

BRICKDAM, GEORGETOWN

MEMBERS OF THE NATIONAL ASSEMBLY (69)

Speaker (1)

*Hon Dr. Barton U.A. Scotland, O.R., C.C.H., M.P., Speaker of the National Assembly 

MEMBERS OF THE GOVERNMENT (36)

(i) A Partnership For National Unity/Alliance For Change (36)

First Vice-President and Prime Minister (1)

+ Hon. Moses V. Nagamootoo, J.P., M.P., First Vice-President and Prime Minister

Other Vice-Presidents (3)

+ Hon. Carl B. Greenidge, M.P., Vice-President and Minister of Foreign Affairs 

+Hon. Khemraj Ramjattan, M.P., Vice-President and Minister of Public Security

+*Hon. Sydney Allicock, M.S., M.P., Vice-President and Minister of Indigenous 

      Peoples’ Affairs 

Attorney General and Minister of Legal Affairs (1)

+ Hon. Basil Williams, M.P., Attorney General and Minister of Legal Affairs  

Senior Ministers (13)

+ Hon. Amna Ally, M.P., Minister of Social Protection and Government Chief Whip

+ Hon. Lt. Col. (Ret’d) Joseph F. Harmon, M.S.M., M.P., Minister of State

+ Hon. Dr. Rupert Roopnaraine, M.P., Minister of Education              

        /…2

+ Cabinet Member

*Non-Elected Member

2.

+ Hon. Ronald A. Bulkan, M.P., Minister of Communities

+ Hon. Dr. George A. Norton, M.P., Minister of Social Cohesion
+ Hon. Winston D. Jordan, M.P., Minister of Finance 

+ Hon. Raphael G.C. Trotman, M.P., Minister of Natural Resources

+ Hon. Volda A. Lawrence, M.P. (Region No. 4 – Demerara/Mahaica),

   Minister of Public Health
+ Hon. David A. Patterson, M.P., Minister of Public Infrastructure

+ Hon. Catherine A. Hughes, M.P. (Region No. 4 – Demerara/Mahaica),

    Minister of Public Telecommunications  

+*Hon. Winston G. Felix, D.S.M., M.P., Minister of Citizenship 

+ Hon. Hans Dominic Gaskin, M.P., Minister of Business 
+Hon. Noel L. Holder, M.P., Minister of Agriculture 

Ministers (9)

*Hon. Keith Scott, M.P., Minister within the Ministry of Social Protection 

Hon. Dawn Hastings-Williams, M.P. (Region No. 7 – Cuyuni/Mazaruni),

Minister within the Ministry of Communities 

Hon. Annette N. Ferguson, M.P., Minister within the Ministry of Public Infrastructure

Hon. Valerie Garrido-Lowe, M.P., Minister within the Ministry of Indigenous Peoples’ Affairs

Hon. Jaipaul Sharma, M.P. (Region No. 4 – Demerara/Mahaica),

Minister within the Ministry of Finance 

Hon. Dr. Karen Cummings, M.P. (Region No. 4 – Demerara/Mahaica),

Minister within the Ministry of Public Health

Hon. Simona Charles-Broomes, M.P., Minister within the Ministry of Natural Resources

Hon. Nicolette O. Henry, M.P., Minister within the Ministry of Education

Hon. Valarie Patterson, M.P. (Region No. 10 – Upper Demerara/Upper Berbice),

Minister within the Ministry of Communities      

           /…3

+ Cabinet Member

*Non-Elected Member

3.
Other Members (9)

Ms. Jennifer J. Wade, M.P. (Region No. 5 – Mahaica/Berbice)

Ms. Rajcoomarie Bancroft, M.P. (Region No. 8 –Potaro/Siparuni)

Mr. John Adams, M.P. (Region No. 3 – Essequibo Islands/West Demerara) 
Mr. Richard Allen, M.P. (Region No. 1 – Barima/Waini)

Mr. Michael Carrington, M.P.

Mr. Jermaine Figueira, M.P. (Region No. 10 – Upper Demerara/Upper Berbice)

Mr. Charrandas Persaud, M.P. (Region No. 6 – East Berbice/Corentyne)

Mr. Haimraj Rajkumar, M.P. (Region No. 2 – Pomeroon/Supenaam)

Mr. Audwin Rutherford, M.P.

MEMBERS OF THE OPPOSITION (32)

(i) People’s Progressive Party (32)

Mr. Bharrat Jagdeo, M.P., Leader of the Opposition 

Mr. Clement J. Rohee, M.P.

Ms. Gail Teixeira, M.P., Opposition Chief Whip  

Mr. Mohamed Irfaan Ali, M.P. (Region No. 3 – Essequibo Islands/West Demerara) 

Mr. Mohabir A. Nandlall, M.P. (Region No. 4 – Demerara/Mahaica) 



Ms. Priya D. Manickchand, M.P. (Region No. 5 – Mahaica/Berbice) (Absent)
Dr. Frank C.S. Anthony, M.P. 

Ms. Pauline Campbell-Sukhai, M.P. 

Mr. Odinga Lumumba, M.P. 

Bishop Juan A. Edghill, M.S., J.P., M.P. 
           /…4

4.

Mr. Dharamkumar Seeraj, M.P. 

Dr. Vindhya V. Persaud, M.S., M.P.
Ms. Indranie Chandarpal, M.P.,
Mr. Joseph L.F. Hamilton, M.P. (Absent)
Mr. Collin D. Croal, M.P. (Region No. 1 – Barima/Waini) 

Ms. Gillian R. Burton-Persaud, M.P. (Region No. 4 – Demerara/Mahaica) 

Dr. Bheri S. Ramsaran, M.P.  
Dr. Jennifer Westford, M.P. (Region No. 7 – Cuyuni/Mazaruni) 

Ms. Africo Selman, M.P.

Mr. Zulfikar Mustapha, M.P. (Region No. 6 – East Berbice/Corentyne) 

Mr. Ganga Persaud, M.P. 

Ms. Yvonne Pearson- Fredericks, M.P. 

Mr. Neendkumar, J.P., M.P. (Region No. 4 – Demerara/Mahaica) 

Mr. Komal Chand, C.C.H., J.P., M.P. (Region No.3 – Essequibo Islands/West Demerara) 
Dr. Vishwa D.B. Mahadeo, M.P. (Region No. 6 – East Berbice/Corentyne)  

Mr. Cornel Damon, M.P. (Region No. 2 – Pomeroon/Supenaam)
Mr. Alister S. Charlie, M.P. (Region No. 9 – Upper Takutu/Upper Essequibo)

Mr. Nigel D. Dharamlall, M.P.

Mr. Adrian V. Anamayah, M.P., 
Mr. Harry Gill, M.P. 

Ms. Bhagmattie Veerasammy, M.P.
Mr. Vickram O. Bharrat, M.P.          

           /…5
5.

Officers (2)
Mr. Sherlock E. Isaacs, A.A., Clerk of the National Assembly

Ms. Hermina Gilgeours, Deputy Clerk of the National Assembly

COMMENCEMENT OF SITTING

The Sitting commenced at 2.43 p.m.

PRAYERS

The Clerk read Prayers.
PUBLIC BUSINESS
-

(i) GOVERNMENT BUSINESS


BILLS – Second Readings
ITEM 1    -
INTOXICATING LIQUOR LICENSING (AMENDMENT) BILL 2016 –       
Bill No. 32/2016 published on 2016-12-20

The Minister of Finance moved the second reading of the following Bill:

A BILL intituled AN ACT to amend the Intoxicating Liquor Licensing Act.

(Read a first time on 2016-12-20)
Bishop Juan Edghill spoke to the motion.

Thereafter, the Minister of Finance replied.

The Bill was then read a second time.

Assembly resolved itself into Committee to consider the Bill clause by clause.

           /…6
6.
In Committee

Clauses 1 and 2 were passed as printed.

Assembly resumed

On a motion by the Minister of Finance, the Intoxicating Liquor Licensing (Amendment) Bill 2016 was read a third time and passed as printed.

ITEM 2     -
      MISCELLANEOUS LICENCES (AMENDMENT) BILL 2016 – Bill 
      No. 33/2016 published on 2016-12-20
      The Minister of Finance moved the second reading of the following Bill:



A BILL intituled AN ACT to amend the Miscellaneous Licenses Act.

(Read a first time on 2016-12-20)
The following Members spoke to the motion.


Mr. Dharamkumar Seeraj

Mr. Zulfikar Mustapha


Mr. Alister Charlie


Mr. Vickram Bharrat


Ms. Yvonne Pearson-Fredricks


Mr. Colin Croal

Thereafter, the Minister of Finance replied.

The Bill was then read a second time.

Assembly resolved itself into Committee to consider the Bill clause by clause.

In Committee

Clause 1 was passed as printed.
Clause 2 was passed as printed on the following division:

           /…7
7.

AGAINST








FOR 
Mr. Bharrat








 Mr. Rutherford

Ms. Veerasammy
Mr. Rajkumar 

Mr. Gill
Mr. C. Persaud

Mr. Anamayah
Mr. Figueira
Mr. Dharamlall
Mr. Carrington
Mr. Charlie
Mr. Allen
Mr. Damon
Mr. Adams
Mr. Chand
Ms. Bancroft
Mr. Neendkumar
Ms. Wade
Ms. Pearson-Fredericks
Ms. Patterson
Mr. G. Persaud Selman
Ms. Henry
Mr. Mustapha
Ms. Broomes
Ms. Selman
Dr. Cummings
Dr. Westford                                                                                           
Mr. Sharma
Dr. Ramsarran                                                                                              Ms. Garrido- Lowe
Ms. G. Persaud
Ms. Ferguson
Mr. Croal                                                                                                Ms. Hastings- Williams
Ms. Chandarpal
Mr. Holder
Dr. V. Persaud
Mr. Gaskins
Mr. Seeraj
Ms. Hughes
Bishop Edghill
Mr. Patterson
Mr. Lumumba  
Ms. Lawrence
Ms. Campbell- Sukhai                                                                          
Mr. Trotman
Dr. Anthony
Mr. Jordan
Mr. Nandlall                                                                                            
Mr. Norton
Mr. Ali
Mr. Bulkan
Ms. Teixeira
Mr. Roopnaraine
Mr. Rohee                                                                                                Lt. Col. (Ret’) Harmon
Mr. Jadgeo
Ms. Ally
                                     


           /…8       
                                                             8.                      
                                             
Mr. Williams

Mr. Ramjattan


Mr. Greenidge


Mr. Nagamootoo
_______________
                                                                            ______________
                                                                                                 29








    33
_______________






   _______________

Assembly resumed

On a motion by the Minister of Finance, the Miscellaneous Licences (Amendment) Bill 2016 was read a third time and passed as printed.

SUSPENSION OF SITTING

At 4.55 p.m., the Sitting was suspended for refreshments.

RESUMPTION OF SITTING

At 6.00 p.m. the Sitting was resumed.

ITEM 3    - 
   TAX (AMENDMENT) BILL 2016 – Bill No. 34/2016 published on 
   2016-12-20
   The Minister of Finance moved the second reading of the following Bill:



A BILL intituled AN ACT to amend the Tax Act.

(Read a first time on 2016-12-20)

The following Members spoke to the motion.


Ms. Gillian Burton- Persaud

Ms. Gail Teixeira

           /…9

10.

Thereafter, the Minister of Finance replied.

The Bill was then read a second time.

Assembly resolved itself into Committee to consider the Bill clause by clause.

In Committee

Clause 1 was passed as printed.
Clause 2 was passed as printed






Assembly resumed

On a motion by the Minister of Finance, the Tax (Amendment) Bill 2016 was read a third time and passed as printed.

ITEM 4   -     
     TRAVEL VOUCHER TAX (AMENDMENT) BILL 2016 – Bill 

     No. 35/2016 published on 2016-12-20
     The Minister of Finance moved the second reading of the following Bill:



A BILL intituled AN ACT to amend the Travel Voucher Tax Act.

(Read a first time on 2016-12-20)
The following Members spoke to the motion.


Ms. Gillian Burton- Persaud


Mr. Adrian Anamayah


Ms. Gail Teixeira

Thereafter, the Minister of Finance replied.

The Bill was then read a second time.

         /…11
11.

Assembly resolved itself into Committee to consider the Bill clause by clause.

In Committee

Clause 1 was passed as printed.
Clause 2 was passed as printed






Assembly resumed

On a motion by the Minister of Finance, the Travel Voucher Tax (Amendment) Bill 2016 was read a third time and passed as printed.

SUSPENSION OF SITTING

At 7.50 p.m., the Sitting was suspended for refreshments.

RESUMPTION OF SITTING

At 8.30 p.m. the Sitting was resumed.

ITEM 5   -        FINANCIAL ADMINISTRATION AND AUDIT (AMENDMENT) 

  BILL 2016  Bill No. 36/2016 published on 2016-12-20

  The Minister of Finance moved the second reading of the following Bill:

A BILL intituled AN ACT to amend the Financial Administration and Audit Act.

                                       (Read a first time on 2016-12-21)





The following Members spoke to the motion.


Mr. Mohamed Irfaan Ali


Mr. Mohabir Nandlall

Thereafter, the Minister of Finance replied.

         /…12
12.

The Bill was then read a second time.

Assembly resolved itself into Committee to consider the Bill clause by clause.

In Committee

Clause 1 was passed as printed.
Clause 2 was passed as printed






Assembly resumed

On a motion by the Minister of Finance, the Financial Administration and Audit (Amendment) Bill 2016 was read a third time and passed as printed.
ITEM 6    -       INCOME TAX (AMENDMENT) BILL 2016 – Bill No. 31/2016 

  published on 2016-12-20
The Minister of Finance moved the second reading of the following Bill:



A BILL intituled AN ACT to amend the Income Tax Act.

(Read a first time on 2016-12-20)
While Bishop Juan Edghill was speaking to the motion the First Vice-President and Prime Minister moved the suspension of Standing Order No. 10(1).
SUSPENSION OF STANDING ORDER NO. 10(1)

At 9.47 p.m., the First Vice-President and Prime Minister moved that Standing Order No. 10(1) be suspended to enable the Sitting to continue to midnight.
Thereafter, Bishop Juan Edghill continued and concluded his speech.

         /…13

13.

The following Members also spoke to the motion:
Dr. Vindhya Persaud
Mr. Vickram Bharrat

Mr. Cornel Damon

Mr. Komal Chand

Mr. Mohabir Nandlall

Thereafter, the Minister of Finance replied.

The Bill was then read a second time.

Assembly resolved itself into Committee to consider the Bill clause by clause.

In Committee

Clause 1 was passed as printed.
Clause 2 was passed as printed





Clause 3 

The Minister of Finance moved the following amendments which were put and carried:
“For the words “employee’s salary” substitute the words “individual’s total income from all sources excluding income subject to withholding taxes under section 39(1)”.”
Clause 3 was then passed as amended.
Clause 4
The Minister of Finance moved the following amendments which were put and carried:
Substitute the following –

“Section 20A(1) of the Principal Act is amended by the substitution for the words “thirty million dollars” of the words “fifteen million dollars” and this amendment shall apply to a loan obtained on or after 1st January 2017.”

/…14
14.
Clause 4 was then passed as amended.
Clause 5 was passed as printed.
Clause 6 
The Minister of Finance moved the following amendments which were put and carried:
Substitute the following –

“Section 33F(1) of the Principal Act is amended as follows –

(a) by substitution for the words “ten percent” of the words “twenty percent”;

(b) by the substitution for the full stop at the end, of a colon;

(c)  by the insertion of the following proviso – 

“Provided that for the purpose of calculating the amount of tax to be withheld, there shall be allowed a deduction of seven hundred and twenty thousand dollars per annum apportioned according to the individual’s earning period.”.”

Clause 6 was then passed as amended.
Clause 7 was passed as printed.
Clause 8  
The Minister of Finance moved the following amendment which was put and carried:
“In the inserted section 36A, delete the words “tax on the”.”
Clause 8 was then passed as amended.
         /…15

15.

Clause 9  
The Minister of Finance moved the following amendments which were put and carried:
Substitute the following –

                “Section 39 of the Principal Act is amended as follows –

         (a) (i)   in subsection (6), by the substitution for the full stop at the end, of a colon;

              (ii)  by the insertion of the following proviso to  subsection (6) – 

“Provided that this subsection does not apply to payments disbursed to contractors under subsection (13).”;
(b)  by the insertion of the following subsections –

“(13)   Payments disbursed to contractors in excess of five hundred thousand dollars for a contract shall be subject to a withholding tax at a rate of two percent on every payment.

(14)    In this section “contractor” means a person contracting with or employed directly by an owner or an agent of the owner 
to supply services, goods, materials, equipment, or personnel in the furtherance of the services”.”
Clause 9 was then passed as amended.
Clauses 10, 11 and 12 were passed as printed.
Clause 13 

The Minister of Finance moved the following amendments which were put and carried:
(a) “In paragraph (b), by the deletion of the words “(b)”.
/…16  

        16.
(b) In paragraph (c), by the substitution for the words “sections 60(1), (4B) or 60 (4)” of the words “section 60(1)(b), (4) or (4B)”.

(c)   In paragraph (d), by the insertion immediately before the word “by” of the words “in subsection (3),”.”
Clause 13 was then passed as amended
Clause 14 was passed as printed.
Clause 15

The Minister of Finance moved the following amendments which were put and carried:
“In the inserted section 102A, for subsection 4(b) and (c) substitute the following –
               “(b) in any other case, within ten days after the  distress is levied,

the property distrained upon may be sold by public auction, or  in such other manner as provided in regulations.”.”
Clause 15 was then passed as amended

Clauses 16, 17 and 18 were passed as printed.

Assembly resumed

On a motion by the Minister of Finance, the Income Tax (Amendment) Bill 2016 was read a third time and passed as amended.
         /…17
17.
MOTIONS

ITEM 7   -   
AFFIRMATION OF THE TRAVEL TAX REGULATIONS 2016 –
 No. 7 of 2016



The Minister of Finance moved the following motion:

BE IT RESOLVED:

That this National Assembly, in accordance with Section 56 of the Tax Act, Chapter 80:01, affirm the Travel Tax Regulations 2016 (No. 7 of 2016) which was made on 19th December, 2016, under Section 56 of the Tax Act, Chapter 80:01 and published in the Official Gazette dated 19th December, 2016.

(Notice Paper No. 78 (M 63  Govt 40) published on 2016
Ms. Gail Teixeira spoke to the motion.

Presiding by Mr. John Adams, M.P.

At 11:58 p.m. the Speaker withdrew from the Chamber and Mr. John Adams, M.P., took the Chair.

Speaker’s Return to the Chamber

At 12:01 a.m. the Speaker returned to the Chamber.

Thereafter, the Minister of Finance replied.

The motion was then put and carried.

             /…18
18.

ITEM 8    -     AFFIRMATION OF THE VALUE-ADDED TAX (AMENDMENT) 

REGULATIONS 2016 – NO. 8 OF 2016

The Minister of Finance moved the following motion:

BE IT RESOLVED:

That this National Assembly, in accordance with Section 95 of the Value-Added Tax Act, Chapter 81:05, affirm the Value-Added Tax (Amendment) Regulations 2016 (No. 8 of 2016) which was made on 19th December, 2016, under Section 95 of the Value-Added Tax Act, Chapter 81:05, and published in the Official Gazette dated 19th December, 2016.

(Notice Paper No. 79 (M 64 Govt 41) published on 2016-12-20)

The following Members spoke to the motion:

Dr. Frank Anthony

Ms. Pauline Campbell- Sukhai

Ms. Gail Teixeira

Thereafter, the Minister of Finance replied.

Ms. Gail Teixeira, M.P., Opposition Chief Whip, and seconded by Bishop Juan Edghill, M.P., moved the following amendments which were put and negatived:

“Insertion of a new Be It Resolved Clause before the original Be It Resolved as follows:-

“BE IT RESOLVED;
That this National Assembly, deletes the amendments to Regulations 13 and 14 in the Table contained in the Value- Added Tax (amendment) Regulations 2016(No. 8 of 2016);”

        /…19

19.

That the original BE IT RESOLVED clause be amended as follows;-

BE IT RESOLVED:

That this National Assembly, in accordance with Section 95 of the Value- Added Tax Act, Chapter 81:05, affirm the amendments to Regulations 2 and 3 contained in the Table of the Value - Added Tax (Amendment) Regulations (No. 8 of 2016) which was made on 19th December, under Section 95 of the Value- Added Tax Act, Chapter 81:05 and published in the Official Gazette dated 19th December, 2016.”
Thereafter, the motion was put and carried.
ITEM 9    -  
 CONFIRMATION OF THE CUSTOMS (AMENDMENT OF 

 SCHEDULES) ORDER 2016 – NO. 17 OF 2016

The Minister of Finance moved the following motion:

BE IT RESOLVED:

That this National Assembly, in accordance with Sections 8 and 43 of the Customs Act, Chapter 82:01, confirm the Customs (Amendment of Schedules) Order 2016 (No. 17 of 2016) which was made on 19th December, 2016, under Section 8 of the Customs Act, Chapter 82:01, and published in the Official Gazette dated 19th December, 2016.

(Notice Paper No. 80 (M 65   Govt 42) published on 2016-12-20)

Mr. Mohamed Irfaan Ali spoke to the motion.

Thereafter, the Minister of Finance replied.

The motion was then put and carried.

         /…20
20.
ADJOURNMENT
At 12.50 a.m. the First Vice- President and Prime Minister moved a motion for the adjournment of the Assembly to 2.00 p.m. on Monday, 30th January, 2017.
Thereafter, Ms. Gail Teixeira, M.P., Opposition Chief Whip, moved an amendment to adjourn the Assembly to the 27th January, 2017.  Subsequently, the amendment was withdrawn by Ms Gail Teixeira, M.P.
At 1.05 a.m., on a motion by the First Vice-President and Prime Minister, the Assembly was adjourned to 2.00 p.m. on Monday, 30th January, 2017.

                                             …………………………………………………………………….  
           HON. DR. BARTON U.A. SCOTLAND, O.R., C.C.H., M.P., 






Speaker of the National Assembly

PARLIAMENT OFFICE,

Public Buildings,

Brickdam,

Georgetown.
6th January, 2017.

