THE OFFICIAL GAZETTE - 18TH AUGUST, 1984
LEGAL SUPPLEMENT - B

GUYANA No. 42 of 1984.

ORDER
Made Under

THE MINISTERS, MEMBERS OF THE NATIONAL ASSEMBLY
AND SPECIAL OFFICES (EMOLUMENTS) ACT.

(Cap. 1:07)

IN EXERCISE OF THE POWERS CONFERRED UPON ME BY SECTION
4 OF THE MINISTERS, MEMBERS OF THE NATIONAL ASSEMBLY

AND SPECIAL OFFICES (EMOLUMENTS) ACT, I HEREBY MAKE
THE FOLLOWING ORDER:—

1. This Order, which amends the Ministers, Members of the J tation
National Assembly and Special Offices (Allowances) (Order)*, maycommence.
be cited as the Ministers, Members of the National Assembly and ™™
Special Offices (Allowances) (Amendment) Order 1984, and shall be

deemed to have come into operation on 1st February, 1984.

2.  The Schedule to the Principal Order is hereby amended — Amendment

(a) by the substitution in paragraph 1 (1) for the wordsd! '€

“§350” of the words “$700”; o
Principal
Order.
(b) by the substitution in paragraph 1 (2) for the words
“$350" of the words “$700"; and
©

by the substitution in paragraph 3 for the words “$350”
of the words “$700".

Made this 23rd day of July, 1984.

Carl B. Greenidge,
Minister of Finance and Economic Planning.

*Cap. 1:07 Subsidiary Legislation.



	Page 1

