
306 THE OFFICIAL GAZETTE LEGAL SUPPLEMENT - .B 19TH AUG .. 19.

GUYANA 

REGULATIONS

J\1ade Under

THE POST AND TELEGRAPH ACT

{Cap. 47:0lJ

No. 35 of 1989

IN EXERCISE OF THE POWERS CONFERRED UPON ME BY 
SECTION 97 OF THE POST AND TELEGRAPH ACT, 1 HEREBY
MAKE THE- FOLLOWING REGULATJONS :-

CitaUon., 1. These Regulations, which amend the Cash on Delivery
(Overseas Parcels Posti Regulations'', may be cited as the Cash 
on Delivery (Ovesreas Parcels Post) (AmendmentJ Regulations
1989. 

·Am
-r 

0.J)clm
1 

teoti 2. Regulation 4 of the Principal Regulations is herebv
e, regu a 10n . . ._ .. 

4 or the amended by the subst1tut10n for the words "$192" of the words
�/�&ins

, "$2200" wherever the words occur.

Amendment 3. Regulation 6 of the Principal Regulations is hereby
6\�

e
��

auon amended in the following respects -
Principal 
Regulations, 

,(a) 

(b) 

by the substitution for the words "$5.00" of the
words "$10.00"; 

bv the substitution for the wonis "$4.80" of the
words "$55.00" wherever foe words occur; 

(c) by the substitution for the words •·4 cents" of the
words "$2.40"; and 

(d) by the substitution for the words "60 cents" of
the words "$4.80". 

*Cap. 47:01 Subsidiary Legislation.

Made this 8th day of August, 1989.

Robert Corbin,

Deputy Prime Minister.
Public Utilities. 


	Page 1

