No.
BRITISH GUIANA.
REGULATIONS
* MADE UNDER
THE LEGISLATIVE COUNCIL
ORDINANCE, 1945.
(No. 13 of 1945).

(ELECTIONS)

UNDER SECTIONS 13 AND 33 OF THE LEGISLATIVE
COUNCIL (ELECTIONS) ORDINANCE, 1945, THE

FOLLOWING REGULATIONS HAVE BEEN MADE

BY THE GOVERNOR IN COUNCIL:—

1. These Regulations may be cited as the Legislative
Council (Ilections) (Amendment) Regulations, 1947, and
shall be construed with the Legislative Council (IElections)
Regulations, 1945.

)

2. Regulation 9 of the Principal Regulations is hereby
amended Dby the substitution for the words “3lst day of
August, 19467 in sub-regulation (1), of the words “30th
day of April, 19477,

3. Regulation 10 of the Principal Regulations is hereby
amended Dby the substitution for the words “17th day of
September, 1946” in paragraph (a) of sub-regulation (2),
of the words “15th day of May, 1947”.

4. Regulation 11 of the Principal Regulations is hereby
amended Dby the substitution for the words “17Tth day of
September, 1946 in paragrapl (a) of sub-regulation (1),
of the words “15th day of May, 1947”.

5. Regulation 12 of the Principal Regulations is hereby
amended Dby the substitution for the words “24th day of
September, 1946” in paragraph (a) of sub-regulation (1),
of the words “22nd day of May, 1947”.

6. Regulation 15 of the Prineipal Regulations is hereby
amended Dby the substitution for the words “between the
9th day of October, 1946 and the 24th day of October, 1946”
in paragraph (a) of sub-regulation (1), of the words
“Detween the Gth day of June, 1947, and the 21st day of June,
19477,

B 11
G of 1947.

Short tiile.
No. 42 of
1945

A mend-

ment of
regulation
9 of the
Principal
Regula-

tions,

A mend-
ment of
regulation
10 of the
Principal
Regula-
tions,

A mend-
ment of
regulation
11 of the
Principal
Regula-
tions.

Amend-
ment of
regulation
12 of the
Principal
Regula-
tions.
Ameng-
ment of
regulation
15 of the
Principal
Regula-
tions.



B 12

Amend-
ment of
regulation
18 of the
Principal
Regula-
tions.

Amend-
ment of
regulation
19 of the
Principal
Regula-
tions.

Regula-
tions 2 to
8 to have
effect not-
withstand-
ing any-
thing to
the con-
trary

in regula-
tions 3, 9,
10, 11, 12,
15, 18 and
19 of the
Principal
Regula-
tions.

Revocation
and sub-
stitution

of regula-

the Prin-
cipal
Regula-
tions.

“Hours
tion 27 of voting.

7. Regulation 18 of the Principal Regulations is hereby
amended—

(a) Dby the substitution for the words “9th day of
November, 1946” in paragraph (a) of sub-
regulation (1), of the words “6Gth day of July,
19477; and
by the substitution for the words “23rd day of
November, 1946” in paragraph (a) of sub-
regulation (3), of the words “20th day of July,
19477,

8. Regulation 19 of the Principal Regulations is hereby
amended by the substitution for the words “30th day of
November, 194G” in paragraph (a) of sub-regulation (1), of
the words “3Ist day of July, 19477,

9. Regulations two to eight inclusive of these Regula-
tions shall have effect notwithstanding anything contained
to the contrary in— '

(a) sub-regulation (2) of regulation 3;
(b) sub-regulation (2) of regulation 9;

)

(c¢) paragraph (L) of sub-regulation (2) of regula-
tion 10;

(d) paragraph (b) of sub-regulation (1) of regula-
tion 11;

(e) paragraph (b) of sub-regulation (1) of regula-
tion 12;

(f) paragraph (b) of sub-regulation (1) of regula-
tion 15;

(g) paragraph (D) of sub-regulation (1) of regula-
tion 18;

() paragraph (Db) of sub-regulation (3) of regula-
tion 18; and

(i) paragraph (b) of sub-regulation (1) of regula-

tion 19—
of the Principal Regnlations.
10. Regulation 27 of the Principal Regulations is hereby

revoked, and the following smubstituted therefor _
of 27. The poll shall be taken bhetween the hours

of seven in the morning and five in the afternoon.”

Made by the Governor in Council this 23rd day of April, 1947,
JOHN C. MALONE,

Clerk to the Executive Council.




