
B 11 

No. 6 of 1947. 

BRITISH GUIANA. 

REGULATIONS 

'MADE UNDER 

THE LEG1SLATIVE COUNCIL (ELEO'rIONS) 
ORDINANCE, 1945. 

(No. 13 of 1945). 

UNDER SEO'l'IONS 13 AND 33 OF THE LEGISLATIVE 
COUNCIL (ELEC'rIONS) ORDINANCE, 19-!5, THE 
FOLLO"'\VI:XG REGULA'rIONS HA VE BEEN MADE 
BY THE GOVERNOR I:N COU:KCIL :-

1. These Regulutions may be cited as the Legislative Short tiLle.

Council (Elections) (Amendment) Regulations, 1947, and No. 42 of 
shall be construed with the Legislative Council (Elections) 1945 

Regulations, 1945. 

2. Regulation 9 of the Principal Regulations is hereby Amend-
ment of 

amended by the substituti-0n for the words "31st day of regulation 
Atwust 19-!6" in snb-re0·ulation (1) of the words "30th 9 ,0f. the

0 , 0 · ' Pnnc1pal 
clay of April, 1947". Regula-

ti ons. 
3. Regulation 10 of the Pl'incipal Regulations is hereby Amend­

amended by the substitution for the words "17th day of ����ati�� 
September, 19-!6" in paragraph (a) of sub-regulation (2), 10 of the 
of the words "15th day of May, 1947", �:

i

:iff_
a
l

tions, 
4. Regulation 11 of the Principal Regulations is hereby Amend-

amended by the substitution for the words "17th day of ment of 
regulation 

September, 19-!6" in paragraph (a) of sub-regulation (1), 11 of the 
of the words "15th day of May l.947". Principal ' Regula-

tions. 
5. Regulation 12 of the Principal Regulations is hereby Amend­

amended by the substitution for the words "24th day of ment of . . regulation 
September, l!J-!6" in paragraph (a) of sub-regulation (1), 12 of the 
of the words "22nd· day of May 1947". Pri ncipal ' Regula-

6. Rel/:n.lation 15 of the Principal Regulations is hereby A
tions. 

d � men -
amended by the substitution f-or the words "between the ment of 
9th clay of October, 1946 and the 24th clay of October, 19-:1:6" �:gu�fti�� 
in paragraph (a) of sub-regulation (1), of the words Principal
"between the Gth day of June, 19-!7, and the 21st day of June, ��

n
gula-
s, 

1947". 

I 
_ _J 



B 12 

Amend­
ment of 
regulation 
18 of the 
Principal 
Regula­
tions. 

Amend­
ment of 
regulation 
19 of the 
Principal 
Regula­
tions. 

Regula­
tions 2- to 
8 to have 
effect not­
)Withstand­
ing any­
thing to 
the con­
ti·ary 
in regula­
tions 3, 9, 
10, 11, 12, 
'15. 18 and 
19 of the 
Principal 
Regula­
tions. 

7. Regulation 18 of the Principal Regulations is hereby
amendea-

(a) by the substitution for the words "9th day of
November, 19J6" in paragraph (a) of sub­
regulation ( 1), of the words "6th day of July,
1947"; and

(b) by the substitution for the words "23rd day of
November, 1946" jn paragraph (a) of sub­
regulation ( 3), of the words "20th day of July,
1947".

8. Regulation 19 of the Principal Regulations is hereby
amended 5y the substitution for the words "30th day of 
November, 194Ci" in paragraph (a) of sub-regulation (1), of 
the words "31st day of July, 1947". 

9. Regulations two to eight inclusive of tliese Regula-
tions shall have effect notwithstanding anything contained 
to the contrary in-

(a) sub-regulation (2) of regulation 3;

( b) suo-regulation (2) of regulation 9;
( c) paragraph (b) of sub-regulation (2) of regula-

tion 10;
(cl) paragraph (b) of sub-regulation (1) of regnla-

tion 11;
( e) paragraph (b) of sub-regulation (1) of regula-

tion 12;
(f) paragraph (b) of sub-regulation (1) of regula­

tion 15;
(g) paragraph (b) of sub-regulation (1) of regula­

tion 18;
(h) paragTaph (b) of sub-regulatjou (3) of regula­

tion 18; and
(i) pnrag·raph (b) of sub-regulation TfT of regula­

tion 19,-
or the Princi1,al Reg11lations. 

...,.-

Revocation 10. Reg·ulation 27 of the Principal Regulations is hereby 1 
!�fut!��

b
- 1'evokecl, and the following· substituted therefor-

of regula- "Hours of '27. ThP poll i:;hall be taken between tlie hours 
tion 27 of voting. f . l • d f' • th ft "
the Prin- O' i::even m t 1e morning an 1ve 111 e a_ erno-on. 

��;�Ia- Made by t-lic Voven1or 'in Council tl1is 23rd clay of Avril, 1947. 
tions. JOHN C. MALONE. 

Clerk to the Executive Council. 

r 


