CE NO. 26 OF 1956.
CIVIL LIST (AMENDMENT No. 2) ORDINANCE, 1956.

T assent.

,D.w ',lMSW\

Governor.

& July, 1936.

BRITISH GUIANA.

ARRANGEMENT OF SECTIONS.

Section.
1. Short title.
2. Amendment of section 2 of the Principal Ordinance.
3. Amendment of section 4 of the Principal Ordinance.
4, Amendment of the schedule to the Principal Ordinance.
5. Commencement.

AN OrpiNaNnce further to amend the Civil List Ordinance by
increasing the amount which shall be payable to Her Majesty
for defraying the expenses of certain services.

Enacted by the Legislature of British Guiana:— A.D. 1956,

1. This Ordinance may be cited as the Civil List (Amend- short title.
ment No. 2) Ordinance, 1956, and shall be construed and read as
one with the Civil List Ordinance, hereinafter referred to as the

C : . ; Cap. 68,
Principal Ordinance, and any Ordinance amending the same. P



No. 26]

2

THE LAWS OF BRITISH GUIANA [A.D. 1956

Amendment
of section
2 of the
Principal
Ordinance.

aAmendment
of section
4 of the
Principal
Ordinance.

Amendment
of the sche-
dule to the
Principal
Ordinance.
No. 22 of
1955.

No. 4 of
1956.

Commence~
ment.

2. Section 2 of the Principal Ordinance as amended from time
to time is hereby further amended by the substitution for the
words “fifty-two thousand eight hundred and fifty” of the words
“fifty-three thousand and fifty”.

3. Section 4 of the Principal Ordinance as amended from time
to time is hereby further amended by the substitution for the
words “fifty-two thousand eight hundred and fifty” of the words
“fifty-three thousand and fifty”.

4. The schedule to the Principal Ordinance as substituted by
section 4 of the Civil List (Amendment) Ordinance, 1955, and as
amended by section 4 of the Civil List (Amendment) Ordinance,
1956, is hereby further amended—

(a) by the substitution for the figures “1750” appearing
against each of the following designations of the
figures “1800”: —

“The Solicitor General”,

“The Commissioner of Lands and Mines”,
“The Comptroller of Customs”,

“The Postmaster General”;

(b) by the substitution for the total “£52,650” «f the
total “£53,050".

5. This Ordinance shall be deemed to have come into opera-
tion on the 1st January, 1954.

Passed by the Legislative Council this twenty-eighth day of
June, nineteen hundred and fifty-siz.

/ nn
Clerk of the Législatfire
(C.S.M.P. C. 231/1 III).

(Leg. Bill No. 30/1956).

Printad hy the Government Priaters of Pritish Guiana.



