
• 

.� 

ORDINANCE NO. 27 OF 1956. 

AUDIT DEPARTMENT (AMENDMENT) ORDINANCE, 1956. 

BRITISH GUIANA. 

I assent. 

J ),� s ,,.._ •
, .  ,,.___ 

G overnor. 

f:>
.... 

July, 1956. 

ARRANGEMENT OF SECTIONS. 
Section. 

1. Short title.
2. Amendment of section 3 of the Principal Ordinance.
3. C ommencement.

AN ORDINANCE furt'her to amend the Audit Department Ordinance 
for the .purppse of increasing the salaries of the Director of 
Audit and the Senior Auditor. 

Enacted by the Legislature of British Guiana:- A�6. 
1. This Ordinance may be cited as the Audit Department Short title. 

(Amendment) Ordinance, 1956, and shall be construed -and read Cap. 69. 

as one with the Audit Department 01dinance, hereinafter referred 
to as the Principal Ordinance, and any Ordinance amending the 
same. 



No. 27] 

Amendment 
of section 3 
oC the Prin• 
cipal Ordin• 
ance. 

Commence• 
ment. 

2 

THE LAWS OF BRITISH GUIANA [A.D. 1956 

2. Section 3 of the Principal Ordinance as amended from
time to time is hereby further amended -

(a) by the substitution for the words "three thousand two
hundred" appearing in subsection (1) of the words
"three thousand three hundred";

(b) by the substitution for the words "one thousand seven
hundred and fifty'' appearing in paragraph (a) of
subsection (2) of the words "one thousand eight
hundred";

(c) by the substitution for the words "one thousand four
hundred and fifty" appearing in paragraph (b) of

subsection (2) of the words "one thousand five
hundred".

3. This Ordinance shall be deemed to hav.e come into opera­
tion on the 1st January, 1954. 

Passed by the Legisl(1;tiv-ei Council this twenty-eighth day of 
June, nineteen hundred and fifty-six. 

/ol;� 
(C.M.P. 7/3) 

Clerk of the Legis$ure. 

(Leg. Bill No. 29/1956). 

Printed by the Government Printers o!· British Guiana. 


