
GUYANA 

ACT No. 4 of 2012 

INCOME TAX (AMENDMENT) ACT 2012 

s�
enl

l\
�k,

-
Donald Ramotar, 
PJJsident.

/!p11l &-1 ';,)r·1 2:: 

/ 
/ 

ARRANGEMENT OF SECTIONS 

SECTION 

1. Short title and commencement.
2. Amendment of section 8 of the Income Tax Act.
3. Amendment of section 20 of the Income Tax Act.
4. Amendment of section 60 of the Income Tax Act.

PRICE: $130.00- To be purchased from Parliament Office, Georgetown, Guyana.
PRINTED BY GUYANA NATIONAL PRINTERS LIMITED.



2 

No. 4 LAWS OF GUYANA lA.D. 2012] 

AN ACT to amend the Income Tax Act. 

A. D. 2012 

Short title and 
commencement. 

Cap81:0I 

Amendment of 
Section 8 of the 
Income Tax 
Act. Cap. 8 I :0 I 

Amendment of 
Section 20 of 
the Income ·1 ax 
Act. Cap. 81:01 

Amendment of 
Section 60 or 
the Income Tax 
Act. Cap. 81:0 I 

Enacted by the Parliament of Guyana:-

1. (1) This Act, which amends the Income Tax Act, may be cited as the Income Tax
(Amendment) Act 2012. 

2. 

3. 

4. 

(2) The amendments to the Income Tax Act shall come into operation with
res peel to and from the yjar of assessment commencing on the I st January,
2013. .

Sections 8 (I) and (4) of the Income Tax Act are hereby amended by the 
substitution for the words i"four hW1dred and eighty thousand dollars" of the
words "six hundred thousabd dollars" 

Section 20 of the Incom� Tax Act is hereby amended by the substitution 
for the words "four hunclred and eighty thousand dollars" of the words 
"six hundred thousand dollars". 

Section 60(1 )(a) of th1 Income Tax Act is hereby amended by the 
substitution for the words "four hundred and eighty thousand dollars" of 
the words "six hundred �housand dollars". 

Passed by the National Assembly on 26'h April, 2012. 

(BILL No. 4/2012) 

� 
SE. Isaacs, 

Clerk of the National Assembly. 


