THE OFFICIAL GAZETTE 20™ DECEMBER, 2016
LEGAL SUPPLEMENT — C

Tuesday 20" December, 2016

BILL No. 33 of 2016

PARLIAMENT OFFICE
Public Buildings,
Georgetown,

Guyana.

20" December, 2016.

The following Bill which will be introduced in the National Assembly is published for general

information.
S.E. Isaacs,
Clerk of the National Assembly.
GUYANA
BILL No. 33 of 2016
MISCELLANEOUS LICENSES (AMENDMENT) BILL 2016
ARRANGEMENT OF SECTIONS
SECTION
1. Short title.

2. Amendment of the Principal Act.



678 THE OFFICIAL GAZETTE [LecAL SuppLEMENT] — C 20™ DECEMBER, 2016

A BILL
Intituled

AN ACT to amend the Miscellaneous Licences Act.

AD20I6 Enacted by the Parliament of Guyana:-
Short title. 1. This Act, which amends the Miscellaneous Licences Act, may be cited as the
Miscellaneous Licences (Amendment) Act 2016.
Amendmentofthe 2. The provisions of the Principal Act specified in column one of the Table are
Principal Act. amended in the manner specified in the corresponding entries in column two.
TABLE
SECTION AMENDMENT
Section 10 (1) (a) by substituting for the words “six dollars” the words “five thousand
dollars™;
(b) by substituting for the words “one hundred and fifty dollars” the words
“ten thousand dollars”.
Section 12 by substituting for the words “three hundred dollars” the words “ten thousand
dollars”.
Section 17 (a) by substituting for the word “fifteen dollars” the words “ five thousand
dollars™;
(b) by substituting for the words “one hundred and fifty dollars” the words
“ten thousand dollars”.
Section 18 (2) | by substituting for the words “one hundred and fifty dollars” the words “five
thousand dollars”.
Section 19 (2) by substituting for the words “one hundred and fifty dollars” the wdrds “ten
thousand dollars”.




THE OFFICIAL GAZETTE [LecAL SuppLEMENT] — C

20™ DECEMBER, 2016 679

Section 20 (2) | by substituting for the words “seventy-five dollars” the words “seven
thousand five hundred dollars”.

Section22 (1) | (a) by substituting for the words “seventy-five dollars” the words “seven

thousand five hundred dollars™;
(b) by substituting for the words “one hundred and fifty dollars” the words
“ten thousand dollars”.

Section 23 (1) | by substituting for the words “one hundred and fifty dollars” the words “ten
thousand dollars”.

Section 23 (2) | by substituting for the words “one hundred and fifty dollars” the words “ten
thousand dollars”.

Section 23 (3) | by substituting for the words “one hundred and fifty dollars” the words “ten
thousand dollars”.

Section 24 by substituting for the words “one hundred and fifty dollars” the words “ten
thousand dollars”.

Section 27 by substituting for the words “seventy-five dollars” the words “seven
thousand five hundred dollars”.

Section 29 by substituting for the words “three hundred dollars” the words “fifteen
thousand dollars”.

Section 33 (1) | by substituting for the words “thirty dollars” the words “sixteen thousand
dollars”.

Section 33 (3) | by substituting for the words “seventy-five dollars” the words “seven
thousand five hundred dollars™.

Section 37 (a) by substituting for the words “thirty dollars” the words “six thousand

dollars™;

(b) by substituting for the words “one hundred and fifty dollars” the words

“fifteen thousand dollars”.




680 THE OFFICIAL GAZETTE [LecAL SuppLEMENT] — C 20™ DECEMBER, 2016

EXPLANATORY MEMORANDUM

The Bill seeks to amend the Act by increasing most of the prescribed fines.

O
Hon. Winston Jordan, M.P
Minister of Finance



